
 

 
 AGENDA 

VILLAGE BOARD 
VILLAGE OF SUSSEX 

6:00 PM - TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 27, 2022  
SUSSEX CIVIC CAMPUS – BOARD ROOM 2nd FLOOR 

N64W23760 MAIN STREET 
 
1. Roll call. 
 
2. Pledge of Allegiance. 
 
3. Consideration and possible action on minutes from the Village Board meetings held on 

September 12th, and 13th, 2022.  
 
4. Communications and Public Hearing(s) 

A. Village President Report.  Report on meetings attended/up-coming, communications, 
and recognitions. 

 
5. Committee Reports  

A.  Board of Fire Commissioners Report on discussion and action taken at the previous 
meeting, future agenda items and upcoming meetings.   

 
B. Community Development Authority Report on discussion and action taken at the 

previous meeting, future agenda items and upcoming meetings.  
 

1. Recommendation and possible action on Resolution 22-11 Authorizing 
Amendments to $4,180,000 Community Development Authority of the Village of 
Sussex, (Wisconsin) Redevelopment Revenue Refunding Bonds, Series 2013 
(Lauterbach Group Project) Issued on September 10, 2013. 

 
C. Park & Recreation Board Report on discussion and action taken at the previous 

meeting, future agenda items and upcoming meetings. 
 
D. Pauline Haass Library Board Report on discussion and action taken at the previous 

meeting, future agenda items and upcoming meetings. 
 
1.  Recommendation and possible action on Resolution 22-09 Providing for the 
Exemption from the 2022 Waukesha County Library Tax. 

 
E. Plan Commission Report on discussion and action taken at the previous meeting, 

future agenda items and upcoming scheduled meetings. 
 

F. Public Safety and Welfare Report on discussion and action taken at the previous 
meeting, future agenda items and upcoming meetings. 
 
1. Recommendation and possible action on Resolution 22-10, Adopting the 
Waukesha County All Hazzard Mitigation Plan. 

N64W23760 Main Street 
Sussex, Wisconsin 53089 

Phone (262) 246-5200 
FAX (262) 246-5222 
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6. Staff Reports on upcoming events, projects, future agenda items and scheduled meetings.   
 
7. Comments from citizens present. 
 
8. Old Business.  

A.     Recommendation and possible action on Refuse and Recycling Services Contract with LRS 
 

9. New Business.   
 A.   Consideration and possible action on Intermunicipal Agreement Between Sussex and 

Lannon for Utility Maintenance Services. 
 
10.       Consideration and possible action on resignations and appointments. 
  
11. Adjournment  

 
Anthony LeDonne 

      Village President 
 

       
      ________________________________ 
      Jeremy Smith 
      Village Administrator 
 
 
It is possible that members of and possibly a quorum of members of other governmental bodies of the 
municipality may attend the above stated meeting to gather information; no action will be taken by any 
governmental body at the above stated meeting other than the governmental body specifically referred to above 
in this notice.  Please note that, upon reasonable notice, efforts will be made to accommodate the needs of 
disabled individuals through appropriate aids and services.  For additional information or to request this 
service, contact the Village Clerk at 262-246-5200.                    
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DISCLAIMER‐ THE FOLLOWING ARE DRAFT MINUTES FROM 
THE SUSSEX VILLAGE BOARD  

AND ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE UPON APPROVAL OF THE VILLAGE BOARD 

 

VILLAGE OF SUSSEX 

SUSSEX, WISCONSIN 

 
Minutes of the Village Board Budget Meeting 

September 12, 2022 

 
1. Roll Call 
The meeting was called to order by President LeDonne at 5:30 p.m. 

 
Members present:  Greg Zoellick, Lee Uecker, Scott Adkins, Ron Wells, Stacy Riedel, and President 

Anthony LeDonne. 

 
Members excused:  Trustee Benjamin Jarvis 

 
Also present:  Administrator Jeremy Smith, Assistant Village Administrator Kelsey McElroy Anderson, Finance 

Director Nancy Whalen, Clerk/Treasurer Jennifer Moore, Parks and Recreation Director Halie Dobbeck, 

Community Development Director Gabe Gilbertson, Library Director Adele Loria, Police Captain Lisa Panas, Fire 

Chief Kris Grod, and Finance Cand Personnel Evaluation Committee member Michael Carlson. 

2. Introduction and discussion on 2023 Budget 
Mr. Smith presented the 2023 base budget proposal. 

 
3. Adjournment 

Motion by LeDonne, seconded by Zoellick to adjourn at 6:32 p.m.  Motion carried 7‐0 

Respectfully submitted, 

Jennifer Moore 

Clerk/Treasurer 

 



 

 

DISCLAIMER‐ THE FOLLOWING ARE DRAFT MINUTES FROM 
THE SUSSEX VILLAGE BOARD  

AND ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE UPON APPROVAL OF THE VILLAGE BOARD 
 

VILLAGE OF SUSSEX 
SUSSEX, WISCONSIN 

 
 Minutes of the Village Board Meeting of  

September 13, 2022 
1. Roll Call  
President LeDonne called the meeting to order at 6:00pm. 
 
Members present:   Stacy Riedel, Lee Uecker, Greg Zoellick, President Anthony LeDonne, Ron Wells, 

and Scott Adkins 
 
Members excused:  Trustee Benjamin Jarvis 
 
Also present:  Administrator Jeremy Smith, Assistant Administrator Kelsey McElroy‐Anderson, 

Attorney John Macy, Clerk Jennifer Moore, and members of the Public 
 
2. Pledge of Allegiance  
President LeDonne led the pledge of allegiance.  
 
3. Meeting Minutes  
Motion by Wells seconded by Zoellick to approve the August 23, 2022 Village Board meeting minutes 
as presented.                    Motion Carried 6‐0 
 
4. Communications and Public Hearings 

A.  Village President Report.   
  9/20 – 5:30pm Community Development Authority meeting 

6:00pm Public Safety meeting  
6:30pm Plan Commission meeting 

  9/21 – 6:30pm Library Board 
  9/22 – Pints in the Park and fireworks 
  9/26 – 7:00am brush collection 
    5:30pmBudget workshop 
     
   

5. Committee Reports 
A.  Finance and Personnel Committee 

1. Motion by Adkins, seconded by Uecker to approve the August Check Register and P‐
card Statement in the amount of $2,843,844.11      Motion Carried 6‐0 

 
2. Motion by Adkins, seconded by Riedel to approve the August Ace Hardware purchases 

in the amount of $532.02.            Motion Carried 5‐0 
 



 

 

3. Motion by Adkins, seconded by Riedel to approve an Operator’s License for Harold 
Link.                  Motion Carried 6‐0 

 
4. Motion by Adkins seconded by Uecker to approve a Class B fermented malt beverage and 

Reserve Class B liquor license for El Jimador Mexican Grill, LLC, Agent Antonio Leon Porras.
                  Motion Carried 6‐0 

 
5. Motion by Adkins seconded by Zoellick to approve Resolution 22‐08 Providing for the Sale 

of Approximately $2,280,000 General Obligation Promissory Notes, Series 2022B. 
Motion Carried 6‐0 

 
B.  Public Works Committee 

1. Motion by Adkins, seconded by Uecker to approve the August invoices in the amount of 
$48,771.75.                Motion Carried 6‐0 
 

2. Motion by Adkins, seconded by Wells to approve the Hydrant Maintenance Easement 
made between Wilshire Drive Property LLC and the Village of Sussex for the Courtyard at 
Sussex senior housing.            Motion Carried 6‐0 

 
3. Motion by Adkins, seconded by Zoellick to approve the purchase of the John Deere 6110 

tractor and Tiger mower from Proven Power Inc. for $144,578.93.     
                  Motion Carried 6‐0 

 
4. Motion by Adkins, seconded by Riedel, to approve the Highlands Stormwater Easement 

between Sussex Corporate Park II LLC and the Village of Sussex.  Motion Carried 6‐0 
 

5. Motion by Adkins, seconded by Wells to approve the use of certain sections of village 
property for use by the Sussex Sled Bugs Snowmobile Club, Inc. for the 2022‐2023 season. 

Motion Carried 6‐0 
 

6. Staff Reports 
A. Assistant Administrator McElroy‐Anderson 

a. Community Chat September 22 at Pints in the Park 
b. Curbside brush collection begins at 7:00am 9/26 – one pass, brush only 

B. Administrator Smith 
a. Great Touch a Truck turnout – thank you to staff and attendees 
b. Largest registration for dance 
c. Water main break at connection from town and school district. Repair should 

be done overnight on Thursday – warranty repair 
C. Attorney Macy – report on current court cases 

a. Disabled Voters Entitled to Absentee Ballot Assistance 
b. Sex Offender Ordinances 
c. Rezoning is a Legislative Decision 
d. Temporary Limited Easements Not Compensable 
e. Private Employer cannot block disclosure of record involving former employee 

D. Clerk Moore 



 

 

Nothing to report 
 

7. Comments from citizens present 
  No one present wished to speak. 
 
8. Old Business  

A. Motion by Wells, seconded by Adkins to shade structure at the Grove. (Zoellick voted no) 
Motion Carried 5‐1  

9. New Business  
None 

  
10. Consideration and possible action on resignations and appointments 

None 
 
11. Adjournment 
  Motion by Adkins seconded by Zoellick to adjourn at 6:37pm.       

                    Motion Carried 6‐0 
 
Respectfully submitted, 
Jennifer Moore 
Village Clerk 



 

 
 

M E M O R A N D U M 
To: Village Board 
From: Jennifer Moore, Village Clerk 
Re: Village Board Meeting- September 27, 2022 
Date:  September 22, 2022 
 
4.A. Village President Report- report on meetings attending and upcoming 
communications. 
 
5.B.1. Resolution No. 22-11, A Resolution Authorizing Amendments To $4,180,000 
Community Development Authority Of The Village Of Sussex, (Wisconsin) Redevelopment 
Revenue Refunding Bonds, Series 2013 (Lauterbach Group Project) Issued On September 10, 
2013. A Public Hearing was held as required and this resolution is recommended for approval 
by the Community Development Authority at their meeting on September 20, 2022.  The Bonds 
needed to be amended as the banking industry has changed how it determines its benchmark 
interest rates away from LIBOR.  Please see the Resolution for more information. 
 
5.D.1. The Pauline Haass Public Library Board recommends approval of Resolution 22-09 
Providing for the Exemption from the 2022 Waukesha County Library Tax.  The Village 
annually passes this Resolution to allow Village taxpayers to be exempted from the County 
Library Tax.  It confirms that the Village tax rate to support the Library exceeds that of the 
County Library Tax rate.  Please see the Resolution for more information. 
 
5.F.1.  Staff recommends approval of Resolution 22-10, A Resolution to Adopt the 
Waukesha County All Hazzard Mitigation Plan.  This plan includes emergency government 
mitigation plans for all Waukesha County communities.  The Village adoption of the plan 
allows the Village to be eligible for Federal grants related to emergency preparedness and 
mitigation.  Please see the Resolution and plan for more information. 
 
8.A.  Staff recommends approval of the Refuse and Recycling Services Contract with 
Badgerland LRS. Due to price increases for tire recycling staff also recommends 
elimination of the tire drop off day beginning in 2023 as residents can recycle 2 tires per 
month up to 6 in one year for free as part of the bulk item pick-up garbage service. For 
more information, please see the memo from Public Works Director Judy Neu. 
 
9.A.  Staff recommends approval of the Intermunicipal Agreement Between the Village of 
Sussex and Village of Lannon for Utility Maintenance Services.  The Village will begin 
this service starting October 1 by providing approximately 20 hours per week of utility 
maintenance for their distribution system (excluding well operations).  The Village will 
receive $4,160 per month for a base fee plus any direct expenses or additional hours and 
overtime hours will be fully compensated by Lannon to the Village.  This will allow the 
Village to add an additional public works employee in 2023 for expanded work needs in 
the Village as well.  The contract is a full cost recovery model contract and will run for 5 
years.  Please see the agreement for more information. 
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VILLAGE OF SUSSEX, WISCONSIN 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 22-11 
 
 

 
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AMENDMENTS TO  

$4,180,000 COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY OF 
THE VILLAGE OF SUSSEX, (WISCONSIN) 

REDEVELOPMENT REVENUE REFUNDING BONDS, 
SERIES 2013 (LAUTERBACH GROUP PROJECT)  

ISSUED ON SEPTEMBER 10, 2013 
 

 
 WHEREAS, in a resolution adopted on September 20, 2022, by the Community 
Development Authority of the Village of Sussex (the “Authority”), the Authority authorized 
amendments to the $4,180,000 Community Development Authority of the Village of Sussex, 
(Wisconsin) Redevelopment Revenue Refunding Bonds, Series 2013 (Lauterbach Group Project) 
(the “Bonds”) which were issued on September 10, 2013 for the purpose of refunding the 
$6,500,000 Community Development Authority of the Village of Sussex, (Wisconsin) Variable Rate 
Demand Redevelopment Revenue Bonds, Series 2008 (Lauterbach Group Project); and 
 

WHEREAS, the recommended policies of the Authority require that the Village Board of 
the Village approve the amendment and reissuance of the Bonds; and 

WHEREAS, the Bonds will not be a general obligation or indebtedness of the Authority 
within the meaning of any state constitutional provision or statutory limitation and will not 
constitute or give rise to a pecuniary liability of the Authority or a charge against the Authority’s or 
the Village’s general credit or the Village’s taxing powers, but shall be payable solely from the 
payments and other revenues derived from the Borrower as described in the Authority’s resolution; 
and 

WHEREAS, it is hereby found and determined to be in the best interests of the Village and 
in furtherance of the Authority’s redevelopment objectives for the Authority to proceed with 
amendment and reissuance of the Bonds. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Village Board of the Village of Sussex, 
Wisconsin, as follows: 

Section 1.  Approval.  The amendment and reissuance of the Bonds by the Authority is 
hereby approved. 

Section 2.  Reissuance of Bonds.  The Authority shall proceed to reissue the Bonds in the 
form and upon the terms set forth in the First Amendment to Bond Agreement to be entered into 
by and among the Authority, the Borrower, BMO Harris Bank N.A., as Original Purchaser, and 
BMO Harris Bank N.A., as successor Trustee. 
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  Dated:  September 27, 2022. 
VILLAGE OF SUSSEX, WISCONSIN 

 
 
By:       
       Anthony J. LeDonne, Village President 

 
 

By:       
      Jennifer Moore, Village Clerk 
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CERTIFICATION BY VILLAGE CLERK 

 
 
 I, Jennifer Moore, being first duly sworn, hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting 
Village Clerk of the Village of Sussex, Wisconsin (the “Village”), and as such I have in my possession, 
or have access to, the complete corporate records of the Village and of its Village Board; that I have 
carefully compared the transcript attached hereto with the aforesaid records; and that said transcript 
attached hereto is a true, correct and complete copy of all the records in relation to the adoption of 
Resolution No. ______ entitled: 
 

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AMENDMENTS TO 
$4,180,000 COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY OF THE VILLAGE OF SUSSEX, 

(WISCONSIN) REDEVELOPMENT REVENUE REFUNDING BONDS, SERIES 2013 
(LAUTERBACH GROUP PROJECT) ISSUED ON SEPTEMBER 10, 2013 

 
 I hereby further certify as follows: 
 
 1. Said Resolution was considered for adoption by the Village Board at a meeting held at 
Village Hall, N64 W23760 Main Street, Sussex, Wisconsin, at _____ p.m. on September 27, 2022.  Said 
meeting was a regular meeting of the Village Board and was held in open, public session. 
 
 2. Said Resolution was on the agenda for said meeting and public notice thereof was given 
not less than twenty-four (24) hours prior to the commencement of said meeting in compliance with 
Section 19.84 of the Wisconsin Statutes, including, without limitation, by posting on the bulletin board 
in the Village Hall, by notice to those news media who have filed a written request for notice of 
meetings, and by notice to the official newspaper of the Village of Sussex. 
 
 3. Said meeting was called to order by _____________________, who chaired the 
meeting.  Upon roll, I noted and recorded that the following trustees were present: 
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
and that the following trustees were absent: 
 
             
 
             
 
 I noted and recorded that a quorum was present.  Various matters and business were taken up 
during the course of the meeting without intervention of any closed session.  One of the matters taken 
up was said Resolution, which was introduced, and its adoption was moved by 
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______________________ and seconded by ______________________.  Following discussion and 
after all trustees who desired to do so had expressed their views for or against said Resolution, the 
question was called, and upon roll being called and the continued presence of a quorum being noted, 
the recorded vote was as follows: 
 
 AYE: 
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
 NAY: 
 
             
 
             
 
 
 ABSTAIN OR NOT VOTING: 
 
             
 
             
 
 
 WHEREUPON, the meeting chair declared said Resolution adopted, and I so recorded it. 
 
 
 IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have signed my name and affixed the seal of the Village hereto 
on this 27th day of September, 2022. 
 
 
 
     VILLAGE OF SUSSEX, WISCONSIN 
 
 [SEAL] 
     By:______________________________________________ 

  Jennifer Moore, Village Clerk 

 



























STATE OF WISCONSIN  VILLAGE OF SUSSEX WAUKESHA COUNTY 

RESOLUTION No. 22-09 

RESOLUTION FOR EXEMPTION FROM 2022 WAUKESHA COUNTY LIBRARY TAX 

WHEREAS: The Village of Sussex funds the Pauline Haass Public Library so that it may serve Sussex, 
Lisbon and the customers of the Waukesha County Federated Library System,  

WHEREAS:  The Village’s proportional share of the costs of the Pauline Haass Public Library is in 
excess of the County rate in the prior year of $0.229096 per $1,000 Equalized Value and  

WHEREAS:  The Village must annually certify by the enactment of a resolution pledging that it will 
appropriate and allow the library to expend no less than a rate of $0.229096 per $1,000 
times the actual State Equalized Value amount for the Village that was published by the 
State on August 9, 2022. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Village Board of the Village of Sussex, Waukesha County, 
Wisconsin that:  

1. The Village Board hereby certifies that the Village will appropriate and allow the Pauline Haas Public 
Library to expend no less than a rate of $0.229096 per $1,000 times the actual State Equalized 
Value for the Village for 2023 in order to allow for the continued operation of the Library.  
 

2. The Village is eligible for exemption from the County Library levy.  
 

3. The Village Clerk is hereby authorized and directed to sign the “Notice of Exemption from 
Waukesha County Library Levy- 2022 Tax for 2023 Purposes” and to provide it to the Waukesha 
County Federated Library System as well as the Waukesha County Clerk for their records.  

Adopted this 27th day of September, 2022  

 

Anthony J. LeDonne, Village President  
 

 
Jennifer Moore, Village Clerk 



U.S. Department of Homeland Security 
          FEMA Region 5 
          536 S. Clark St. 6th Floor 
          Chicago, IL 60605 

 

www.fema.gov 

 

 
 
 
 

August 25, 2022 
 
 
Ms. Guenevere Drewes 
State Hazard Mitigation Officer 
Wisconsin Emergency Management  
2400 Wright Street, P.O. Box 7865 
Madison, WI  53707-7865 
 
Dear Ms. Drewes: 
 
Thank you for submitting the adoption documentation for the Waukesha County, Wisconsin Hazard 
Mitigation Plan. The plan was reviewed based on the local plan criteria contained in 44 CFR Part 201, as 
authorized by the Disaster Mitigation Act of 2000. The Waukesha County plan met the required criteria for a 
multi-jurisdiction hazard mitigation plan and the plan is now approved for Waukesha County. Please submit 
the adoption resolutions for any remaining jurisdictions who participated in the planning process. 
 
The approval of this plan ensures continued availability of the full complement of Hazard Mitigation 
Assistance (HMA) Grants. All requests for funding, however, will be evaluated individually according to the 
specific eligibility and other requirements of the particular program under which the application is submitted. 
 
We encourage Waukesha County and the participating jurisdictions to follow the plan’s schedule for 
monitoring and updating the plan, and to continue their efforts to implement the mitigation measures. The 
expiration date of the Waukesha County plan is five years from the date of this letter. To continue project 
grant eligibility, the plan must be reviewed, revised as appropriate, resubmitted, and approved no later than 
the plan expiration date. 
 
Please pass on our congratulations to the participating jurisdictions for completing this significant action. If 
you or the communities have any questions, please contact Cadence Peterson at 312-408-5260 or at 
cadence.peterson@fema.dhs.gov.   
 

Sincerely, 
 

 
 
Julia McCarthy 
Deputy Director 
Mitigation Division 
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Waukesha County  

Multi-Jurisdictional All Hazard 

Mitigation Plan Update 
 

Executive Overview 

July 2022 

 

The Waukesha County Multi-Jurisdictional All Hazard 

Mitigation Plan (Plan) was submitted to Wisconsin 

Emergency Management (WEM) and FEMA for review and 

approval in March of this year.  FEMA guidance (Disaster 

Mitigation Act of 2000) requires that the Plan be updated 

every five years.   

 

Waukesha County Emergency Management updated the 

2016 Plan, which now includes 41 participating 

jurisdictions. The plan received FEMA’s Approval Pending 

Adoption (APA) status on May 25, 2022. The county and 

participating jurisdictions must now adopt the plan, within 

one year of the aforementioned date, to have a FEMA-

approved hazard mitigation plan and be eligible for funding 

through the Hazard Mitigation Grant Program (HMGP), the 

Building Resilient Infrastructure and Communities (BRIC) 

program, and the Flood Mitigation Assistance (FMA) 

program. 

 

The planning area for the hazard mitigation plan 

encompasses Waukesha County and includes the 

incorporated and unincorporated jurisdictional areas of the 

county.  

 

Adoption of the Plan makes participants eligible to apply 

for grants funds, and FEMA requires that each 

participating partner adopt the plan by resolution.   

 

The following represent key elements from the Plan 

update:  

• This plan includes all federally required elements of a 

hazard mitigation plan: 

o A description of the planning process 

o The public involvement strategy 

o A list of goals and objectives 

WHAT IS THIS 
PLAN? 

Mitigation is defined in this 

context as any sustained action 

taken to reduce or eliminate 

long-term risk to life and 

property from a hazard event.  

Mitigation planning is the 

systematic process of learning 

about the hazards that can 

affect the community, setting 

clear goals, identifying 

appropriate actions and 

following through with an 

effective mitigation strategy.  

Mitigation encourages long-

term reduction of hazard 

vulnerability and can reduce the 

enormous cost of disasters to 

property owners and all levels 

of government.  Mitigation can 

also protect critical community 

facilities, reduce exposure to 

liability and minimize post-

disaster community disruption.  

 

WHY IS THIS PLAN 
SO IMPORTANT? 

Adoption of the Hazard 

Mitigation Plan makes 

participants eligible to apply for 

grant funds through the 

Building Resilient Infrastructure 

and Communities Program, 

Flood Mitigation Assistance 

Program and Hazard Mitigation 

Grant Program. 
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o A countywide hazard risk assessment 

o Countywide mitigation initiatives 

o A plan maintenance strategy 

This plan has been set up in two volumes so that elements that are jurisdiction-specific 

can easily be distinguished from those that apply to the whole planning area:  

Volume 1 includes all federally required elements of a disaster mitigation plan that apply 

to the entire planning area. This includes the description of the planning process, public 

involvement strategy, goals and objectives, countywide hazard risk assessment, 

mitigation strategy, and a plan maintenance strategy. The following appendices at the 

end of Volume 1 include information or explanations to support the main content of the 

plan: 

o Appendix A - Notice of Endorsement & Adoption 

o Appendix B - Public Outreach & Participation 

o Appendix C - Mitigation Project Examples 

o Appendix D - Federal Funding Sources and Programs 

o Appendix E - Benefit-Cost Analysis Guidance 

o Appendix F - Acronyms and Definitions 

Volume 2 includes all federally required jurisdiction-specific elements, in annexes for 

each participating jurisdiction. 

• 41 total jurisdictions participated in the 2022 Waukesha County Multi-Jurisdictional All 

Hazard Mitigation Plan. 

 
Jurisdiction Involvement 

Waukesha County Meetings; Mitigation Steering Committee Leadership; Mitigation 

Actions/Projects 
Brookfield City Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Delafield City Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Muskego City Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
New Berlin City Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Oconomowoc City Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Pewaukee City Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Waukesha City Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Big Bend Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Butler Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Chenequa Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Dousman Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Eagle Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Elm Grove Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Hartland Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Lac La Belle Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Lannon Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Menomonee Falls Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Merton Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Mukwonago Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
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Nashotah Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
North Prairie Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Oconomowoc Lake Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Pewaukee Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Summit Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Sussex Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Vernon Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Wales Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Waukesha Village Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Brookfield Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Delafield Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Eagle Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Genesee Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Lisbon Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Merton Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Mukwonago Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Oconomowoc Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Ottawa Town Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Lake Country Fire Dept Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 
Eagle Springs Lake Management 

District 
Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 

Western Lakes Fire District Meetings; Mitigation Actions/Projects 

 

• The hazard identification and profiling in the hazard mitigation plan addresses the 

following hazards considered to be of paramount importance within Waukesha County and 

listed in descending order of general risk to the county. It is important to note that the 

Disaster Mitigation Act of 2000 requires that all “natural hazards” be addressed in this plan.  

Hazard impacts were assessed in six categories: population exposure, catastrophic potential 

of the hazard, property damages, property exposure, future development trends, and 

economic potential of the hazard. The probability of occurrence of a hazard is indicated by a 

probability factor based on the likelihood of a “significant” incident occurring on an annual 

basis. 

 

Hazard Event Probability Factor Sum of Weighted 

Impact Factors 

Total (Probability x 

Impact) 

Flooding 3 28 84 

Tornadoes and High 

Winds 

2 25 50 

Winter Storms 2 24 48 

Thunderstorms 3 15 45 

Hail 3 13 39 

Hazardous Materials 

Release 

2 17 34 

Extreme Cold 2 15 30 

Utility Failure 2 15 30 

Lightning 3 9 27 
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Earthquakes 1 24 24 

Droughts and Dust 

Storms 

2 10 20 

Extreme Heat 2 10 20 

Dam Failure 1 16 16 

Forest and Wildfires 1 13 13 

Political Hazard 

(Terrorism & Civil 

Disturbance) 

1 13 13 

Fog 2 6 12 

Rail Transportation 

Incident 

1 11 11 

• One of the bedrock principles of emergency management is to approach issues from an all-

hazards perspective. The planning committee used the all hazards approach to identify 

mitigation goals for the county and all of its municipalities. The purpose of the hazard 

mitigation plan is to identify hazard areas, assess the risks, analyze the potential for 

mitigation and recommend mitigation strategies, where appropriate. Potential mitigation 

projects will be reviewed using criteria that stress the intrinsic value of the increased safety 

for people and property in relation to the monetary costs to achieve this (i.e., a cost-

benefit analysis). With that in mind, the planning goals for this entire plan, as determined by 

the mitigation planning committee are: 

MITIGATION GOALS 
1. To preserve life and minimize the potential for injuries or death. 

• Identify natural and manmade hazards that threaten life in Waukesha County. 

2. To preserve and enhance the quality of life throughout Waukesha County by identifying 

potential property damage risks and recommending appropriate mitigation strategies to 

minimize potential property damage. 

• Implement programs and projects that assist in protecting lives by making homes, businesses, 

essential facilities, critical infrastructure, and other property more resistant to losses from all 

hazards.  

• Improve hazard assessment information to make recommendations for discouraging new 

development and encouraging preventive measures for existing development in areas 

vulnerable to natural hazards.  

• Protect life and property by implementing state-of-the-art standards, codes and construction 

procedures.  

3. To promote countywide coordination, planning, and training that avoids transferring the risk 

from one community to an adjacent community, where appropriate. 

• Continue developing and strengthening inter-jurisdictional coordination and cooperation in the 

area of emergency services.  

• Continue to support and develop comprehensive mutual aid agreements.  

• Continue providing county and municipal emergency services with training and equipment to 

address all identified hazards.  

4. To identify potential funding sources for mitigation projects and form the basis for FEMA 

project grant applications. 

5.  Increase public awareness 



Waukesha County All Hazard Mitigation Plan | Executive Overview  

Page 5 of 5 
 

• Increase public awareness of existing threats and the means to reduce these threats by 

conducting educational and outreach programs to all the various community groups in the 

county.  

• Provide informational items, partnership opportunities and funding resource information to 

assist in implementing mitigation activities.  

 

• The heart of the mitigation plan is the mitigation strategy, which serves as the long-term 

blueprint for reducing the potential losses identified in the risk assessment. The mitigation 

strategy describes how the county will accomplish the overall purpose, or mission, of the 

planning process. In this plan, mitigation actions/projects were updated/amended, 

identified, evaluated, and prioritized. 

 

o A total of 209 mitigation projects were identified for Waukesha County and 

participating jurisdictions.  

o 113 new mitigation projects were identified as part of this update.  

 
 



STATE OF WISCONSIN       VILLAGE OF SUSSEX       WAUKESHA COUNTY 
 
 

Resolution 22-10  
 

A Resolution to Adopt the Waukesha County All Hazard Mitigation Plan 
 
WHEREAS, the Village of Sussex recognizes the threat that natural hazards pose to people and 
property; and 
 
WHEREAS, undertaking hazard mitigation actions before disasters occur will reduce the 
potential for harm to people and property and save taxpayer dollars; and 
 
WHEREAS, an adopted all hazard mitigation plan is required by FEMA as a condition of future 
grant funding for mitigation projects under FEMA pre- and post-disaster mitigation grant 
programs; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Village of Sussex participated jointly in the planning and update process with 
Waukesha County and other local units of government to prepare an All Hazard Mitigation Plan, 
which was made available for review and will reside permanently in the Waukesha County 
Office of Emergency Management; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Wisconsin Emergency Management and Federal Emergency Management 
Agency, Region V, officials have reviewed the 2021 update and approved it contingent upon this 
official adoption of the participating governing body; and  
 
NOW THEREFORE IT IS HEREBY RESOLVED that the Village of Sussex hereby adopts 
the 2021 Waukesha County All Hazards Mitigation Plan as an official plan and do hereby 
endorse and agree to participate in the implementation of the Waukesha County All Hazard 
Mitigation Plan as it applies to this jurisdiction. 
 
 
Passed this _____day of _________2022 
 
 

____________________________ 
               Anthony LeDonne, Village President 

 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
____________________________ 
    Jennifer Moore, Village Clerk 
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M E M O R A N D U M 
To: Village Board 
From: Judith A. Neu, Village Engineer / Public Works Director 
Date: September 22, 2022 
Re: Garbage and Recycling Contract – Badgerland LRS___ _______________________                                                          
 
Staff recommends that the Board approve the Garbage and Recycling Contract with Badgerland 
LRS.  Collection days will be Monday through Thursday as shown on the maps in the packet and 
are described as follows: 
 
Monday:  North of Good Hope Road 
 
Tuesday:  Union Pacific Railroad to Good Hope Road 
 
Wednesday:  South of UPRR and East of Maple Ave plus  

          Main Street to UPRR west of Maple Ave 
 
Thursday:  West of Maple Ave and South of Main Street 
 
In addition, Staff recommends that we eliminate the tire drop off day beginning in 2023.  The 
price for tire drop off with the new provider will increase from $2/tire to $18/tire with the new 
contract.  Residents can have 2 tires per month and up to 6 tires per year picked up during bulk 
item collection at no charge. 

 

N64W23760 Main Street 
Sussex, Wisconsin 53089 

Phone (262) 246-5200 
FAX (262) 246-5222 

Email:  info@villagesussex.org  
Website:  www.villagesussex.org 

mailto:info@villagesussex.org
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M E M O R A N D U M 
To: Public Works Committee 
From: Judith A. Neu, Village Engineer 
Date: July 28, 2022 
Re: Garbage and Recycling Services RFP______                                                                  _ 
 
Proposals for Garbage and Recycling Services were received on July 21, 2022.  Three (3) 
proposals were received and the 2023 costs for each household is summarized below.  The Bid 
details can be found at the end of this memo.  The bidders were: 
 
John’s Disposal, Franksville, WI 
Badgerland / LRS, Milton, WI 
GFL Environmental, Hartland, WI 
 

ANNUAL CONTRACT COST PER RESIDENT 
  

2022 
John’s 
2023 

Badgerland/LRS 
2023 

GFL 
2023 

Weekly garbage and recycling $152.28 $215.40 $166.50 $209.52 
Annual Increase  CPI 3% 6% (2024) 5% (2025-27) 
 
A few notes: 

• Every other week recycling with Badgerland would be $151.00 / household in 2023. 
• No bulky item collection with John’s would be $191.40 / household in 2023. 
• 7-year contract with John’s would be $197.40 / household in 2023. 

 
The major differences between the current services and Badgerland are: 

• Collection days (4 days / week rather than 2).   
• Bulky item call for service once per month vs. call for service collected within 7 days. 

 
Badgerland has been operating in Wisconsin for over 13 years with over 50 communities served 
and is expanding into the Waukesha County area from its new location in New Berlin.  Staff has 
spoken to several other communities that use Badgerland for garbage and recycling and found 
those communities to be happy with the services and customer service provided to their residents.     
 
Based upon the proposal, reference checks and pricing staff recommends that the Village enter 
into a 5-year contract with Badgerland / LRS for garbage and recycling services.  The transition 
would occur starting January 1 with new carts distributed in December.  The Village will roll out 
a significant communication effort about the change in garbage companies and service dates if a 
vendor other than John’s is selected.  Representatives from Badgerland will be on hand to answer 
questions.  Please see the next page for details on the bid totals for more information. 
 
 
 
 

 

N64W23760 Main Street 
Sussex, Wisconsin 53089 

Phone (262) 246-5200 
FAX (262) 246-5222 

Email:  info@villagesussex.org  
Website:  www.villagesussex.org 

mailto:info@villagesussex.org
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The Request for Proposals included the base bid and 4 alternatives as discussed with the 
Committee in May. 
 
Base Bid:   Match current services – weekly garbage and recycling, on demand Bulk Item 

Collection (+/- 1-2 week service window), 5 year contract. 
Alternate #1:  Change from weekly to every other week recycling. 
Alternate #2:  Weekly garbage and recycling, prescheduled date for bulky item collection (call 

for service). 
Alternate #3:  Weekly garbage and recycling, resident pays direct for bulky item collection. 
Alternate #4:  Match current services, 7-year contract term. 
 

2022 Rates 
(John's 
Disposal)

John's 
Disposal 2023

Annual 
Increase

Badgerland / 
LRS 2023

Annual 
Increase

GFL Environmental 
2023

Annual Increase

Weekly Refuse $8.61 $11.00 CPI * No Bid No Bid $10.49 6% year 2, 5% 3-5
Weekly Recycling $4.08 $6.95 CPI * No Bid No Bid $6.97 5%
Extra Bulk (>10 items) Paid 
direct by resident $45.05 $95.00 CPI * No Bid No Bid

$30 first, $20 each 
item after, Freon $45

$1 / year for each 
service

Tires $2.00 $4.00 CPI * No Bid No Bid $10.00 $1 / year

Every Other Week Recycling N/A No Bid No Bid $2.75 3% $4.35 5%

Weekly Refuse $8.61 No Bid No Bid $9.85 3% $10.99 5%
Weekly Recycling N/A No Bid No Bid $4.05 3% $6.97 5%
Extra Bulk (>10 items) Paid 
direct by resident $45.05 No Bid No Bid $50.00 $55 in year 4

$30 first, $20 each 
item after, Freon $45

$1 / year for each 
service

Tires $2.00 No Bid No Bid $18.00 $20 in year 4 $10.00 $1 / year

Weekly Refuse $8.61 $9.50 CPI * No Bid No Bid $9.99 5%
Weekly Recycling $4.08 $6.45 CPI * No Bid No Bid $6.97 5%
Extra Bulk (>10 items) Paid 
direct by resident N/A $95.00 CPI * No Bid No Bid

$30 first, $20 each 
item after, Freon $45

$1 / year for each 
service

Tires $2.00 $4.00 CPI * No Bid No Bid $10.00 $1 / year

Weekly Refuse $8.61 $9.75 CPI * $9.85 3% $10.49
6% year 2, 5% 3-5, 

2.5% year 6

Weekly Recycling $4.08 $6.70 CPI * $4.05 3% $6.97
5% year 2-5, 2.5% 

year 6
Extra Bulk (>10 items) Paid 
direct by resident $45.05 $95.00 CPI * $50.00 $55 in year 4

$30 first, $20 each 
item after, Freon $45

$1 / year for each 
service

Tires $2.00 $4.00 CPI * $18.00 $20 in year 4 $10.00 $1 / year

CPI* Rates negotiated annually and may increase up to CPI on contract anniversary date

Base Bid - Match Current Services (weekly garbage and recycling)

Alternate #1 - Every Other Week Recycling

Alternate #2 - weekly garbage and recycling, prescheduled date for bulky item collection

Alternate #3 - Weekly garbage and recycling, No Bulky Item Collection

Alternate #4 - weekly garbage and recycling, 7 year contract term
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AGREEMENT FOR THE PROVISION OF UTILITY MAINTENANCE SERVICES BETWEEN 
THE VILLAGE OF SUSSEX AND THE VILLAGE OF LANNON 

(Sec. 66.0301, Wis. Stats.)  
 

This AGREEMENT, entered into this ______ day of September, 2022, between the Village of Lannon 
organized and existing under the laws of the State of Wisconsin with principal offices at 20399 W Main 
St, Lannon, WI 53046, (“Lannon”) and the Village of Sussex, a Municipal Corporation organized and 
existing, under the laws of the State of Wisconsin with principal offices at N64 W23760 Main Street, 
Sussex, WI 53089, (“Sussex”) is as follows:  
 
WITNESSETH:  
 
WHEREAS, Lannon owns and operates a system of water supply, storage, pumping, and distribution 
facilities which has capacity for supplying water utility service to properties in Lannon; and  
 
WHEREAS, Lannon owns and operates a sewage collection, interceptor, and lift station system to 
collect and transfer sewage to the Sussex Treatment Plant, and 
 
WHEREAS,  Lannon and Sussex along with other communities have existing intermunicipal 
agreements for the payment and operation of the Lannon interceptor system, which obligates Lannon to 
perform certain operational and maintenance functions on portions of the system; and 
 
WHEREAS, Lannon has used and wishes to continue to use contracted services as it is the most efficient 
means to operate the water and sewer systems, collectively herein as “Lannon’s Utilities”; and 
 
WHEREAS, Lannon approached Sussex about Lannon contracting with Sussex for various 
maintenance and operational services for Lannon’s Utilities, and 
  
WHEREAS, Sussex has significant experience, leadership, equipment, and labor capabilities with 
respect to Utility operations, and 
 
WHEREAS, Sussex already performs maintenance for utility operations for the Town of Lisbon and 
Sanitary District and in certain aspects of the Lannon interceptor system, and 
 
WHEREAS, Sussex believes there is great efficiency in providing services for Lannon’s Utilities, and 
 
WHEREAS, Lannon’s Utilities continued growth and complexity requires more advanced and 
consistent maintenance, and 
 
WHEREAS, Lannon will benefit from a consistency of maintenance and connection with Sussex 
Utility operations, and 
 
WHEREAS, Lannon and Sussex are willing to enter a contract for Utility maintenance/operational 
services under§66.0301, Wis. Stats; and  
 
WHEREAS, in consideration of the payment and terms herein and the benefits derived by each, 
Lannon and Sussex contract and agree as follows:  
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A. RECITALS  
The representations and recitations in the foregoing Recitals are material to this Agreement and are 
incorporated into and made a part of this Agreement as though they were set forth in this Paragraph 
A and constitute representations and understandings of Sussex and Lannon according to the tenor 
and import thereof.  
 
B. GENERAL INTENT AND OWNERSHIP  
Lannon will continue to own Lannon Utility assets and it will be Lannon’s responsibility and its sole 
expense, to acquire necessary land and easements and plan, design, and construct Lannon’s Utility 
facilities as necessary including but not limited to, water mains, service laterals, and booster pump 
stations, back-up generators, sewage mains, lift stations, grinder pumps, SCADA, billing system, etc. 
to serve Lannon Customers.  Sussex shall not own any of Lannon’s Utilities assets, except what 
ownership right it may have from owned capacity within the Lannon Interceptor or other separate 
agreement between the parties.  This agreement shall revolve around maintenance, and operational 
services provided by Sussex to Lannon as outlined in exhibit A.  Lannon acknowledges that Sussex 
has a primary responsibility to the Village of Sussex and its utility customers and Sussex shall where 
emergency conflicts between service to Lannon and Sussex first stabilize Sussex issues prior to 
addressing services under this contract.   
 
 
C.  MAINTENANCE AND OPERATIONAL ASSISTANCE 

1. Sussex shall provide maintenance and operational services as outlined in Exhibit A. The 
services each week will require about 20 hours of work during standard hours to complete.  
 

2. Standard hours are from 7:30 AM to 3:30 PM Monday through Friday.  The Sussex work 
week is Saturday at 12:00 AM to Friday at Midnight.  Holiday hours are determined by 
Sussex and are considered on-call hours.   

3. Sussex shall also provide on-call services for Lannon Utilities to address off hour and 
emergency issues.  On-Call hours are all hours outside of the Standard Hours.  All on call 
service calls have a minimum of 2 hours of billable time. 

 

4. Sussex shall solely manage its resources in providing services under this contract. 
 

5. Sussex will use reasonable judgment and the emergency operations guideline attached as 
Exhibit B should emergency repairs to the system be necessary.  Lannon authorizes Sussex 
through this contract to initiate emergency repairs as necessary until and at such time as 
Lannon is able to respond to Sussex per the emergency contact provision guideline. 

 

6. Sussex shall not be the Operator of record for Lannon’s Water Utility as those services are 
provided via separate contract through a third-party unaffiliated with this agreement.   

 

7. Lannon will provide water meters to Sussex to install on behalf of Lannon Utilities.   
 

8. Lannon will complete at its cost system upgrades including Sussex SCADA upgrades 
necessary for the same such that the lift stations, well houses, and other appropriate Lannon 
Utilities equipment communicates and integrates with the Sussex Scada system to allow 
Sussex to provide services of the contract.  These upgrades shall be completed prior to July1, 
2023.  Lannon shall upgrade the SCADA system as it adds facilities to its system. 
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D.  TERMS 
1. Sussex shall invoice Lannon each month a flat rate of $4,160 for labor under the contract, 

The invoice for this flat rate will identify the portion thereof attributable to each the sewer 
and water utility.   

2. Sussex shall invoice Lannon each month for the following: 
A. Any labor hours over 20 hours in a week during standard hours at a rate of $48 per hour. 
B. Any labor hours for on call hours at a rate of $68 per hour.  
C. For any equipment usage at a rate per hour as shown on the Equipment Reimbursement 

Sheet, attached as Exhibit C. 
D. For any materials, parts, pieces, equipment installed/replaced in the Lannon Utilities 

system plus a 10% administrative handling and storage fee. 
 

3.  The rates in section D are good through December 31, 2022.    
 

4. The rates in Section D may be adjusted annually starting with January 1, 2023, but may 
increase by no more than 5% per year.   

 

5. Lannon shall pay said invoice within 30 days of the date of the invoice.  Delinquent payments 
shall be subject to the same penalties and charges assessed to Sussex Utility customers.  

 

6. Lannon will add Sussex as a named insured on all applicable insurance policies and agrees to 
indemnify Sussex, its officials, employees, and agents with regards to all acts or omissions 
arising from this agreement. 

 
7. Should the volume of customer base/facilities/workload change such that the Village is more 

than 2 weeks per month exceeding the 20 hours per standard week workload than the parties 
agree to negotiate new terms therein to reflect a high volume of work and failure to reach 
agreement on new terms within 90 days of notice of this issue by Sussex to Lannon than 
termination of the agreement may occur under Section F.4. 

 

 
E. BOOKS AND RECORDS  
Lannon and Sussex shall keep accurate books, records, and accounts of costs, expenses, expenditures, 
and receipts as they pertain to this Agreement. Upon reasonable notice, either party may examine any 
such books and records. Either party may request an annual certified audit report of the books and 
records of the other party.  
 

 
F. TERM OF CONTRACT/EARLY TERMINATION 
1. The initial term of this Agreement shall be from October 1, 2022, through December 31, 2026.   
 

2.  The Agreement shall automatically renew for subsequent five (5) year periods if notice of non-
renewal is not provided at least one (1) year prior to the date the agreement would automatically renew. 
 

3.  Early Termination without cause.  After the Initial term either party shall give at least one (1) 
year’s written notice if there is a desire to have an early termination of this contract without cause. 
This is to ensure that safe Utility operations are maintained and for Sussex staffing levels purposes. 
 

4.  Default.  The failure of any party to perform any obligation under this Agreement shall be 
considered a default.  If a default occurs, the defaulting party shall have 30 days from receipt of the 
notice of default to cure the default.  Failure to cure the default may be grounds to terminate for cause.  
Termination for cause shall be given in writing as provided in the Notice section G. 
 

5. The obligation of Sussex to provide services terminates when the agreement terminates. 
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G.  NOTICE 
Any notice required to be given under this agreement shall be given by delivery of regular mail to 
the other party at the following address: 
 

Village Clerk    Village Clerk 
Village of Lannon   Village of Sussex 
Po Box 456     N64W23760 Main Street 
20399 W. Main Street   Sussex, WI 53089 
Lannon, WI 53046    
 

 
H. EFFECT OF AGREEMENT  
Lannon and Sussex recognize this Agreement is the product of a unique set of circumstances. It is 
mutually acknowledged that many provisions contained herein are unique unto themselves and 
should not be precedent for any future agreement between Lannon and Sussex and/or other entities.  
 
 

I. ENTIRE AGREEMENT AND MODIFICATION OF AGREEMENT 
This Agreement embodies the entire Agreement and understanding among the parties.  Any of the 
terms of this Agreement may be modified by written mutual agreement of the parties. 
 
 

J. BINDING AGREEMENT  
This Agreement shall be binding upon the parties and their respective successors and assigns,  
 

 

SIGNATURES ON THE FOLLOWING PAGE 
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VILLAGE OF LANNON, WISCONSIN   VILLAGE OF SUSSEX, WISCONSIN 

Approved by the Lannon Village Board on the Approved by the Sussex Village Board on the 

____ day of _______, 2022.    ______ day of _______, 2022. 

 

By:  ____________________________  By: ___________________________________ 

        Village President      Village President 

 

ATTEST:  ___________________________  ATTEST: ________________________________ 

                     Village Clerk      Village Clerk 
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EXHIBIT A- SCOPE OF SERVICES 
A. Sussex will provide the following operational and maintenance services for Lannon’s public sewer system: 

1. SCADA System (Supervisory Control and Data Acquisition) 
Monitor SCADA system daily and monthly flows at Lannon lift stations and metering stations, 
monitor high flows and other SCADA alerts. 
a. Respond to SCADA Alarms 
b. If necessary, contact appropriate emergency responders. 

 
2. Lift Stations 

a. Weekly Inspection and servicing of the Good Hope, Main Street, and Custer Drive lift stations. 
1) Operate valves per manufactures specification 
2) Inspect wet wells, clean when needed. 
3) Check float systems for proper operation. 
4) Inspect electrical control panels. 

b. Preventive maintenance inside and outside of lift stations, as recommended by O&M manual. 
c. Respond to SCADA Alarms: high water, power fail, seal fail, pump fail, etc. 

 
3. Meter Stations 

a. Inspection of metering stations monthly. 
b. Check daily flow data (SCADA System). 
c. Respond to SCADA Alarm high water, power fail, etc. 
d. Brush flumes quarterly. 

 
4. Grinder Pumps – 5 existing pumps on private laterals 

a. Inspect and operate quarterly. 
b. Clean wet wells and floats when needed. 
c. Respond to pump fail float alarms. 
d. Trouble-shoot electrical problems.  Per Lannon Ordinance, electrical service issues (outside 

the equipment itself) are the property owner’s responsibility and Lannon must therefore 
be notified of any work in this regard to properly bill the property owner. 

 
5. Stand-by Portable Generators     

a. Start two trailer mounted generators monthly. 
b. Change oil and service generators annually per manufacturers’ recommendations. 
 

6. Permanent Stand-by Generators 
a. Inspect weekly 
b. Change oil and service generators annually per manufactures’ recommendations. 

 
7. Customer Service Request 

a. For a call from Lannon residents reporting a basement sewer backup, respond according to the 
following procedures (if there are no widespread problems requiring Sussex personnel to 
respond to emergencies in the Sussex sewer system). 

b. Evaluate the public sewer main. 
1) If blocked, try and open the main by rodding, and or use a vacuum truck to pump 

down the backup to prevent further basement backup. 
2) If the main cannot be cleared, contact appropriate emergency jet cleaning services. 
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3) If the blockage is in the private lateral, the homeowner will be so notified that it is 
up to the homeowner to call a plumber or call the Village of Lannon to proceed. 

B. Sussex will provide the following operational and maintenance services for Lannon’s public water 
system:  
a. Install, repair, replace, and test water meters. 
b. Repair minor above-ground only damage during regular working hours on hydrants resulting 

from vehicle accidents. 
c. Inspect water meters for high/low reads as identified by Lannon. 
d. Coordinate water distribution infrastructure repairs per Exhibit B. 
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Exhibit B – Emergency Repair and Contacting 

 
In the event of an emergency where the residents of Lannon would have an interruption of 
sewer or water services, i.e., sewer main blockage, lift station failure, water main break, a 
Village of Sussex supervisor is authorized to contract with a contractor to perform the 
emergency repairs.  Sussex staff will notify the authorized personnel from the Village of 
Lannon within 2 hours of Sussex receiving notification of the emergency.  
 
 Upon contacting the Lannon authorized person, the Village of Sussex staff will no longer 
be responsible for any decisions regarding the repairs of facility.   
 
If a response from Lannon does not occur within 2 hours, Sussex staff has the authorization 
to respond as most practical, without being held liable for costs incurred.  
 
Lannon will provide Sussex with contact information for the responsible personnel. 
Sussex will provide Lannon with the contact information for the responsible personnel. 
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Exhibit C – Equipment Rate Sheet 

    (Effective through 12-31-2022) 
Utility Truck with Crane  $40.00 
Pick Up Truck    $15.00 
3,000-gallon Vacuum Truck  $85.00  
3-inch Pump    $15.00 
4-inch Pump    $20.00 
6-inch Pump    $25.00 
Valve Power Turner   $25.00 
Confined Space Entry Equipment $16.00 
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